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Aishika Chakroborty is
professor and director of the
School of Women’s Studies,
Jadavpur University.
 Her research interests span
from the gendered history of
the Hindu widows of colonial
Bengal to the many journeys
of women dancers from
colonial to postcolonial
Bengal. An interdisciplinary
scholar, Aishika’s research
straddles gender history,
dance history and feminist
performance.

Aadya Kaktikar currently
holds the position of the Head
of the Department of Art,  
Media and Performance,
Shiv Nadar University. An
Odissi soloist, she made path
breaking research on dance
pedagogy.


